NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:					INVITATION N	UMBER:
Ŭ.		OWERAU		//CLON	() 000	· ·
	LINE ITEM 3  LINE ITEM 4  LINE ITEM 3  LINE ITEM 3  LINE ITEM 4  LINE					
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED:	•	- HI		IODITV	OPENING DAT	E: OPENING TIME:
3		G	JAM POWER AUTH	IORITY	alar lau	G!man
		OWER TO SERV	A DCTD A CT OF DU	DC	7189 189	1.00 (1.11)
DESCRIPTION OF SUPPLIES OR SERVICES:			ABSTRACT OF BI	טט		
Test Switches and Owisent Transformers						
1624 SMITCHES MIN CONSENT TONISTAMES						
			LINE ITEM 2	LINE ITEM 3	LINE ITEM 4	LINE ITEM 5
	5 7 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1		Current Transfirmer 1000-1	5 Chirent Transformy 200:5	Chilliant Trans throw 600:5	
	-		Each			
		8 weeks ARD			8 weeks Apr	
BIDDER A STATE OF THE STATE OF		What of the Convention Callow Last the pro-				Control of Control Charles (Control of Charles)
No.: [ ] Vendor Name: R + D Marketing	BASIC					-1
Bound Paper Original Oty. Bound Paper Copies Oty.	UNIT COST	251.88	no bid	no Bid	no Bid	100
	PART NUMBER				- 1000000000000000000000000000000000000	
[] BID GUARANTEE:		C3-410-E				
[] Bid Bond #: Amount: \$		- Carlotte				
[ ] Certificate of Authority [ ] Power of Attorney						
[] Certificate of Authority [] Power of Attorney  Standby Letter of Credit # 0 - 50 - 30 15 Amount \$ 8,000	DELIVERY	as speabled			1	
[] Letter of Credit # Amount \$	TOTAL LUMP SUM		180 A 180 C		n english and the second of the second of	NAMES OF THE PARTY OF THE PARTY.
[ ] Cashier's or Certified Check # Amount \$						
[] Wire Transfer	ALTERNATE					
[] Affidavits (Original Form)	UNIT COST					
Laffidavits (Copy Form): Originals submitted with 6PA-090-04	PART NUMBER					
Ownership & Interest Disclosure Non-Collusion Li No Gratuities or Kickbacks	CATALOG NUMBER	0.0000000000000000000000000000000000000				
Ethical Standards   Wage Determination   Restriction Against Sex Offendors	MANUFACTURER					
Lausiness License [] Contractors License						200
Litocal Procurement Signed and Submitted						
[ Miterature   Montingent Fees	TOTAL LUMP SUM					
	319428 300 34.50		SECTION OF THE PROPERTY OF THE SECTION OF THE SECTI	NEW CONTRACTOR OF STREET		
I hereby certify that all bids received in response to this invitation were opened under my personal supervision, and that the names of all bidders have been entered herein.  SIGNATURE	-				Basis For Awar  Description:  Basis For Awar  Description:  Description:  Basis For Awar  Description:  Description:  Basis For Awar  Description:  Basis For Awar  Description:  Basis For Awar  Description:  Desc	÷

TABULATED BY: DATE: 9 35 BY

PAGE 1 OF

## NAMES OF PERSONS PRESENT AT THE BID OPENING AND WHOM THEY REPRESENT

PRINT NAME:	COMPANY NAME:	SIGNATURE:	DATE:
1			
2			
3			
4			
5			
6			
7			
8			
9			
10			
11			
12			
13			
14			
15			
16			
17			4
18			
19			
20			*
21			

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:		AROWER AUTHO	PROCUREMENT DIV	ISION	GPA -	ON NUMBER:
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED:		GUA GUA	AM POWER AUTH		OPENING 9125	
DESCRIPTION OF SUPPLIES OR SERVICES: Test Switches and Current Transformers		₩	ABSTRACT OF BIL	)S		
		LINE ITEM 1	LINE ITEM 2	LINE ITEM 3	LINE ITEM 4	LINE ITEM 5
	DESCRIPTION	Test Switch	Ourself Trunstumer 100:5	Durient Transfermer 2000.5	Owent Transformer 400:5	;
	QTY.	46	Ц8	42	LED	
	UNIT	Each	Each	Each	Each	
	DELIVERY	8 weeks ARD	8 Weeks ARD	8 water ADD	8 Week ADD	Brillian School College State State State Service
BIDDER	25 / 7 V / 10 / 10 / 10 / 10 / 10 / 10 / 10 /	Control Control of Control Control Control	g visioning that was drive	Company of the control of the control	A COLORADO DE MONTO A CARROLLA MARIONA AC	
No.: [ 2 ] Vendor Name: anelica's Best Electricmoet	BASIC				B	
	UNIT COST	340.65	649.18	1,200.54	649.79	
Bound Paper Original Qty Bound Paper Copies Qty.	PART NUMBER					
BID GUARANTEE:		C3-410-E	9838497605	983A533601	9838491601	
#Bid Bond #: 00340100003-16 Amount: \$ 15%			-			
The second secon	MANUFACTURER	States	ABB	ABB	ABB	
Certificate of Authority TPower of Attorney	DELIVERY	as specified	35 Week ARO	35 wærs	35 weeks	
[ ] Standby Letter of Credit # Amount \$	TOTAL LUMP SUM					1
[] Letter of Credit # Amount \$	<b>多数的现在分词</b>					CONTRACTOR STATE

I hereby certify that all bids received in response to this invitation were opened under my personal supervision, and that the names of all bidders have been entered herein.

Contingent Fees

[] Cashier's or Certified Check#

[] Affidavits (Copy Form): Originals submitted with

Local Procurement Signed and Submitted

[] Wire Transfer

MAffidavits (Original Form)

Literature

Business

Amount \$

ALTERNATE

**UNIT COST** 

PART NUMBER

CATALOG NUMBER

MANUFACTURER

DELIVERY

TOTAL LUMP SUM

Basis For Award					
[ ]	Lowest Responsive Bidder				
ĒĪ	Tie Bid				
ĺ	Only Bid				
řί	Other Than Lowest Responsive Bidder				

947.73

7507333018

92

as specified

955.78

7504320002

as specified

62

909.37

750x333016

as specified

62

9:00 a.m

PAGE	2	OF	

Ownership & Interest Disclosure | Non-Collusion | No Gratuities or Kickbacks

Ethical Standards | Wage Determination | Restriction Against Sex Offendors

[Jausiness License [] Contractors License / Women Owned Small

TABULATED BY:	Duihungs	DATE:	9125/2	1
	1 TO			Г

NUMBER OF INVITATIONS ISSUED:	ca				INV	ITATION NUMBER:		
9		PROCUREMENT DIVISION				GPA-116-24		
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED:					OPENING DATE: OPENING TIME:  9 25 24 9:00 a.			
<u> </u>		POWER TO SERVE	UAM POWER AUTH	9				
DESCRIPTION OF SUPPLIES OR SERVICES:	$\neg$		ABSTRACT OF BID	OS .				
Test Switches and Current Transformers								
1857 Sultaies and current transformers			and the second second second second second	CV Library and an incident with the CV Married Street, and	No. 40 DC - HONOR CONTRACTOR	SELT MANAGEMENT OF THE SECTION OF TH		
	DESCRIPTION	Tact Switch	Quivert Transfirmer 100:5	LINE ITEM 3	Current Transferred	The second secon	LINE ITEM 5	
	QTY.	46	The state of the s	42	Leo	40.3		
	UNIT	Each	Equi	Each	Each			
BIDDER	DELIVERY	8 Works ARD	8 works ARU	8 Weeks ARD	8 weeks ARO	5.445-7287899 C-427-25-888	100000 BOOKS (200000)	
		下40年的1920年,		A CALL TALKERSON LINES OF THE CALL				
No.: [3] Vendor Name: Benson Gwan Enterpeises	BASIC	no bid	810.50	1,068.50	1,012.50		-	
Bound Paper Original Oty.  Bound Paper Copies Oty.	UNIT COST	TIV BIO	b va.sc	1,000.50	1,014.00			
	PART NUMBER			1				
#BID GUARANTEE:  #Bid Bond #. 202409001000 AGA - 00011  Amount: \$ 15%	CATALOG NUMBER			N NE				
Certificate of Authority Power of Attorney	MANUFACTURER							
[] Standby Letter of Credit # Amount \$	DELIVERY							
[] Letter of Credit # Amount \$	TOTAL LUMP SUM							
[] Cashier's or Certified Check # Amount \$								
[] Wire Transfer	ALTERNATE							
J Affidavits (Original Form)	UNIT COST							
	PART NUMBER	900 (C-R3));						
[ ] Affidavits (Copy Form): Originals submitted with	CATALOG NUMBER							
[ ] Ethical Standards   Wage Determination   Restriction Against Sex Offendors	MANUFACTURER	11			-			
Business License [] Contractors License	DELIVERY							
Litocal Procurement Signed and Submitted								
Literature Contingent Fees	TOTAL LUMP SUM	\$\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\						
I hereby certify that all bids received in response to this invitation were opened under my personal supervision, and that the names of all bidders have been entered herein.  SIGNATURE	CONTRACTOR STATEMENT				Basis  [ ] Lowest Responsive E [ ] Tie Bid [ ] Only Bid	For Award		

PAGE 3 OF 3